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Mike Geisel

From: jfmulliganjr@aol.com
Sent: Wednesday, June 07, 2023 4:19 PM
To: Mike Geisel
Cc: staff@stlmuni.org; Chris Graville; Jeannette Kelly; Elliot Brown; Custodian of Records;

jfmulliganjr@aol.com
Subject: 2023-4-24 Writ Certiorari - Mulligan response 1647

Mike,
     Charter has not filed and served a petition for a writ of certiorari in the U.S. Supreme Court. The deadline was June
5th. Therefore, the judgment in favor of Chesterfield and other class members is final, and the $1,418,467 payment by
Charter to Chesterfield for back taxes near the end of April 2023 is not subject to any claim by Charter to recover it.
     In addition to the back taxes, the judgment requires Charter to pay Chesterfield's telephone license tax on certain
revenue streams Charter has not been including in the tax base. Charter mailed correspondence to class members
around May 22, 2023, informing them that Charter will comply with the judgment but it will take several months to update
tax software (see text below). This should result in a considerable increase in the monthly tax payments by Charter. My
team has a pending motion to enforce the judgment, including the back taxes owed for the period while the case was on
appeal and until the new tax software is in place. No hearing date has been set.
     Please contact me if you have any questions.
     Thank you for your support.

     John

Charter correspondence to class members received May 22, 2023:

To Whom it May Concern:

This follows up on Charter's April 25, 2023 correspondence in which it transmitted to you the amounts due to you pursuant
to the order issued by the Circuit Court of St. Louis County in Collector of Winchester, Missouri, et al., v. Charter
Communications, Inc., et al., Case No. 10SL-CC02719.

Several weeks ago, Charter began the process of adjusting how it calculates the taxes that are the subject matter of that
lawsuit so that payments that post-date the litigation are made in a manner consistent with the court's orders. That
process may take several months because of the necessary updates to the software used to calculate and pay these
taxes.

In the meantime, if you have any questions about the manner or timing of these payments, please do not hesitate to reach
out to Charter at 314-543-2390.

From: mgeisel@chesterfield.mo.us
To: jfmulliganjr@aol.com
Cc: staff@stlmuni.org, cbg@gravillelaw.com, JKelly@chesterfield.mo.us,
ebrown@chesterfield.mo.us, cor@chesterfield.mo.us
Sent: 6/5/2023 6:38:38 AM Central Standard Time
Subject: Re: 2023-4-24 Writ Certiorari - Mulligan response 1647

thank you!

Sent from my iPhone
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On Jun 4, 2023, at 11:56 PM, jfmulliganjr@aol.com wrote:

Mike,
     The deadline for filing a petition for a writ of certiorari in the U.S. Supreme Court is tomorrow
(6/5) unless an extension is requested and granted. The deadline for filing an extension request
was 10 days before the petition is due, except in "extraordinary circumstances." U.S. Sup. Ct. R.
13. Charter has not filed an extension request.
     A petition for a writ of certiorari will be granted only for "compelling reasons." U.S. Sup. Ct. R.
10. Copies of the petition must be served personally, by mail, or by third-party commercial
carrier, and electronically. The electronic version of the petition must be transmitted to all other
parties "at the time of filing or reasonably contemporaneous therewith." U.S. Sup. Ct. R. 29.
      So, we should know within the next 24 hours.

     John

John F. Mulligan, Jr.
Attorney at Law
6 Carrswold
Clayton, MO 63105
(314) 570-7001

From: mgeisel@chesterfield.mo.us
To: jfmulliganjr@aol.com
Cc: staff@stlmuni.org, cbg@gravillelaw.com, JKelly@chesterfield.mo.us,
ebrown@chesterfield.mo.us, cor@chesterfield.mo.us
Sent: 6/4/2023 8:45:03 PM Central Standard Time
Subject: 2023-4-24 Writ Ceriorari - Mulligan response 1647

John:

The prior e mail indicated that Charter would submit “BY” June
fifth.  Don’t know if that means they had to file before, or by COB on
the fifth.  I assume you will let everyone know if Charter did in fact, file
for the Writ of Ceriorari.

This electronic mail transmission and the information contained in it, or attached as a
file to it, are intended for the exclusive use of the intended recipient(s). This email
should be considered "unofficial communication" and does not necessarily reflect the
official position of the City of Chesterfield. An "official position" of the City shall only
be communicated in letter form, using City letterhead. The recipient should check this
email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The City of Chesterfield
accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.

<2023-4-24 Writ Ceriorari - Mulligan response 1647.pdf>



From:                                   Jeannette Kelly
Sent:                                    Thursday, April 27, 2023 2:08 PM
To:                                        Mike Geisel; Chris Graville
Subject:                                FW: Winchester vs. Charter Court Case Settlement Check
Attachments:                      CHARTER ADVANCED SERVICES (MO) LLC - CASE SETTLEMENT.pdf
 
Attached is a copy of the check we received via FedEx today.  This will be deposited tomorrow and placed in deferred revenues
so it will be available if we need to return any of the funds.  We will handle it the same as our other protested payments;
however, with this payment we will wait until we have news as to whether or not the funds will be clawed back before
recognizing as revenue.
 
From: Catherine Pagella <CPagella@chesterfield.mo.us> 
Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2023 2:04 PM
To: Jeannette Kelly <JKelly@chesterfield.mo.us>
Subject: Charter Case Settlement Check
 
 
 
Cathy Pagella
Senior Accountant
City of Chesterfield
690 Chesterfield Parkway West
Chesterfield, MO 63017
Phone: (636) 537-4712
Email: cpagella@chesterfield.mo.us
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